WHATCOM COUNTY BID OPENING RESULTS

THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION IS A RECORD OF BIDDERS AND THEIR BID TOTALS AS RECEIVED AT THE TIME OF THE BID OPENING.
ALL BIDS ARE SUBJECT TO REVIEW BY THE REQUESTING DEPARTMENT AND APPROVAL BY THE COUNTY EXECUTIVE AND THE COUNTY COUNCIL.
A FORMAL AWARD OR REJECTION NOTICE AND TABULATION WILL BE ISSUED TO ALL PARTICIPANTS OR INTERESTED PERSONS ONCE THE BID HAS BEEN AWARDED.

BID 10-32
PUBLIC WORKS — ASPHALTIC MIXES
2:30 TUESDAY 6 April 2010

TYPE OF MIX Associated Asphalt Granite Construction Whatcom Builders

Secton A

HMA Class 1/2” 59.00 56.00 59.00
HMA Class 3/8” 61.00 60.00 63.00
A.T.B. 55.00 42.00 51.00
Cold Mix no bid no bid 105.00
Section B

HMA Class 1/2” no bid 75.00 75.00
HMA Class 3/8” no bid 79.00 78.00
A.T.B. no bid 61.00 66.00
Cold Mix no bid no bid 120.00
Section C

HMA Class 1/2” no bid 80.00 85.00
HMA Class 3/8” no bid 84.00 88.00
A.T.B. no bid 66.00 76.00
Cold Mix no bid no bid 130.00




