
WHATCOM COUNTY BID OPENING RESULTS 
 

THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION IS A RECORD OF BIDDERS AND THEIR BID TOTALS AS RECEIVED AT THE TIME OF THE BID OPENING. 
 ALL BIDS ARE SUBJECT TO REVIEW BY THE REQUESTING DEPARTMENT AND APPROVAL BY THE COUNTY EXECUTIVE AND THE COUNTY COUNCIL.  

 A FORMAL AWARD OR REJECTION NOTICE AND TABULATION WILL BE ISSUED TO ALL PARTICIPANTS OR INTERESTED PERSONS ONCE THE BID HAS BEEN 
AWARDED. 

  
BID 09-17 
PUBLIC WORKS – ASPHALTIC MIXES 
2:30 TUESDAY 24 FEBRUARY 2009 
Prices recorded from vendor plant full tabulation will follow at time of bid award 
 
 

 
 
 
 

TYPE OF MIX Associated Asphalt CEMEX Granite NW Whatcom Bldrs 
     

Asphalt Class B 58.00    70.50 65.50 58.50
Modified Class B 60.00    70.50 63.00 59.50
Asphalt Class G 62.00    73.50 72.50 62.00

A.T.B. 50.00    64.50 45.60 50.00
Cold Mix 98.00    88.00 no bid 105.00
2-Bin Mix no bid no bid no bid no bid 

3-Bin Mix no bid no bid no bid no bid 

4-Bin Mix no bid no bid no bid no bid 

Curb Mix 68.00 no bid no bid no bid 

Standby Rate per hr 250.00 -- 100.00  --
Delivered  w/in 10 mi Prices will be on the 

tabulation no bid Prices will be on the 
tabulation no bid 

Delivered w/in 20 mi Prices will be on the 
tabulation no bid Prices will be on the 

tabulation no bid 


